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Leadership, for a change.



Why does our district 
need a change?
Because incumbent Teague provides 
no leadership. Because he straddles 
issues. Because he avoids clear, firm 
stands on the really tough problems- 
Vietnam, law and order, tax reform, 
equal justice, our cities, etc. Because 
he typifies what is wrong with Con­
gress: too many older, submissive 
politicians losing their constitutional 
power to an unchecked executive; 
losing their feel for the mood of the 
people; losing their ability to solve 
our country's ugly problems. After 
fourteen years in Congress, incum­

bent Teague sits on only two commit­
tees. He introduces no vital legislation. 
He ignores high unemployment rates 
and the need for jobs. He ignores the 
need for light industry to lighten the 
home owner's property tax burden. He 
ignores the need for greater educa­
tional facilities. He ignores air pollu­
tion in Ventura and water pollution in 
Santa Barbara. He ignores the plight 
of the farm workers, but not big agri­
culture. There is an urgent need for 
men of action in Congress. Men who 
will lead, who will work hard, who will 
speak out clearly on the vital issues of 
1968. Men like Stan Sheinbaum.



On Vietnam
The cost is staggering: 205,000 Amer­
ican casualties; one hundred billion 
dollars. And let there be no mistake, 
the war escalated because a weak Con­
gress, including incumbent Teague, 

gave away its traditional voice in for­
eign policy. Teague's token newslet­
ters make vague statements, but on 
the floor of Congress, where it counts, 
he makes absolutely no statements at 
all.

Stan Sheinbaum, for four years a 
governmental consultant in Vietnam, 
has said since 1961 that the American 
people must be told the truth: military 
power cannot solve the political di­
lemma in Vietnam. Only a coalition 
government which includes all politi­
cal forces can achieve peace in this 
ravaged land. The disastrous alterna­
tive is eventual war with Red China.

On Law and Order
A man with an education, a job, a 
home, and a voice in his community 
doesn't protest or riot. Promises not 
kept, problems not solved create dis­
order. Problems like rats running 
rampant in parts of our cities. Incum­
bent Teague voted against the rat­
control bill. Against open housing. 
Against the Housing and Urban 
Development appropriation. In other 
words, against the very bills needed to 
eliminate the causes of discontent, 
lawlessness and disorder.

Stan Sheinbaum, experienced in 
police administration, urges better

trained, better paid police to deal with 
crime and lawlessness. But he also 
believes there must be stronger lead­
ership in Congress to attack the root 
causes of disorder.



On Taxes
Do you think taxes are too high? Ask 
a millionaire who doesn't pay any. Ask 
the Internal Revenue Service which 
can't touch one half the country's in­
come -a loss of forty billion dollars 
every year. Somebody has to make up 
that loss, and that somebody is you 
(unless you happen to be one of the rich 
ones). In 14 years, incumbent Teague 

has chosen to ignore this problem. 
Example: Teague admits the oildeple­
tion allowance is wrong-but once 
again, does nothing about it.

Tax reform is desperately needed. 
If tax loopholes and privileges were 
eliminated, your taxes could be re­
duced by as much as one third.

Stan Sheinbaum, an economist, will 
fight for a fairer distribution of the 
tax burden. He knows there is a lobby 
behind every loophole. He will propose 
legislation to plug loopholes. Shein­
baum will act as a lobby too - for the 
people, and provide leadership, for a 
change.

Vote for Stan Sheinbaum 
for Congress November 5th 
Stan Sheinbaum: printer, lumberjack 
...WW II sergeant ... Stanford '49 ... 
director of three major businesses ... 
consulting economist to Gov't. of 
South Vietnam ('55-'59), California's 
Manpower Commission, U.S. Dep't. of 
Agriculture and other government 
agencies... teacher at UCSB, Stanford, 
Michigan State ... Santa Barbara fam­
ily man.

Stanley K. Sheinbaum, Democrat
Economist
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